
 
 
 

Gulrukhsor Abdullaeva, Director of Women’s Centre “Gulrukhsor” since 2018, and 
involved with the Centre for over 20 years. A lawyer, she is committed to the protection 
of women’s rights and to the provision of services for the rehabilitation of women who 
are victims of violence.  Chair of the newly formed Association of Crisis Centres in 
Tajikistan.   
 
 

Ivan Vostroknutov, Head of Kharkiv City Boxing Club, is a traumatologist and Ukrainian 
boxing champion. Ivan has lived in Kharkov all his life. He wants to help people survive 
this war, restore Ukraine and continue to help civilians around the world. Ivan wants his 
NGO to help those who have found themselves in difficult circumstances. 

 
 

Armen Alaverdyan, CEO, Unison NGO and inclusive Paros Chamber Choir. A survivor 
of myelitis at the age of 22, Armen has dedicated his career to advocating for the rights 
of disabled people in Armenia. He holds a Diploma of Human Rights from Raoul 
Wallenberg Institute (Sweden) and initiated a nation-wide campaign for access and 
transport for people with reduced mobility as well as many projects promoting equal 
opportunities for disabled people.  
 

Iryna Los, Head of Department, Open Doors CSO since 2013. A lawyer, member of the 
Ukrainian Association of Lawyers and monitor in the National Preventive Mechanism. 
2019-2021 expert in OSCE project ‘Promotion of the Human Dimension of Security in 
Ukraine’. Since 2020 head of unit at the NGO ‘Ukraine without Torture’. Since 2021 
Member of the Citizens’ Council at Nikopol City Council. Led 60 international projects 
aimed at protecting human rights and improving the lives of vulnerable people.  
 

Meerim Osmonalieva, Country Director, Oasis (Public Charitable Foundation), for the 
past eight years. Oasis is dedicated to safeguarding the rights of vulnerable children and 
women in Kyrgyzstan. She has a master's degree in Social Development Practice from 
University College London. She specialises in countering human trafficking, gender-
based violence, and illegal migration, as well as the development of democratic 
institutions. She is a graduate of the School of Political Studies of Council of Europe. 

Daria Rybalchenko, Chairman of the Board at the National Network of Local 
Philanthropy. Born in Luhansk oblast, Daria became an internally displaced person at 
the age of 16 in 2014, and again in 2022. Graduated from Kharkiv Polytechnic University 
in heat and power engineering. As a student, an active volunteer in AIESEC (a global 
platform for leadership), other youth initiatives, and in the NGO sector. A fellow in the 
Sur-Place programme of the Konrad Adenauer Foundation, the Leadership Lab of the 
German Marshall Fund and other education programmes. Currently also a director of 

the National Network of Local Philanthropy Development.  


